

EXHIBIT B-2



October 15, 2021

RaPower-3 Receivership
Wayne Klein, Receiver
Klein & Associates
P.O. Box 1836
Salt Lake City, UT 84110

Invoice: 901278
Client: 176390
Matter: 1

INVOICE SUMMARY

Attorney: Jonathan O Hafen

For professional services rendered and costs advanced

RE: Administration of Receivership Estate

Professional Services	\$ 4,114.00
Total Costs Advanced	<u>\$ 1,858.85</u>
TOTAL THIS INVOICE	\$ 5,972.85

PARR BROWN GEE & LOVELESS

Invoice: 901278
 RaPower-3 Receivership
 Administration of Receivership Estate

October 15, 2021
 Client: 176390
 Matter: 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
9/09/21	MSL	Review motion to intervene filed by Preston Olsen; Communication with Jeff Balls re same; Conference with Wayne Klein and Jeff Balls re same	1.40	308.00
9/14/21	MSL	Review briefing related to motion to intervene including ruling by tax court related to motion; Review briefing re same by United States; Research re standard for intervention in case; Communication with United States re same	2.60	572.00
9/15/21	MSL	Review motion to intervene filed by Preston and Elizabeth Olsen; Review tax court opinion re Preston Olsen; Review draft opposition to motion to intervene by United States; Legal research re Rule 24 of Federal Rules of Civil Procedure and Article III standing; Draft response to motion to intervene	4.20	924.00
9/16/21	MSL	Legal research re Rule 24 of the Federal Rules of Civil Procedure including timeliness and inadequate protection of interests; Review motion to intervene filed by Preston and Elizabeth Olsen; Review draft opposition to motion; Communication with Jeff Balls re response to motion to intervene; Draft and revise response to motion to intervene; Communication with Wayne Klein and counsel for the United States re same	8.90	1,958.00
9/17/21	MSL	Communication with counsel for the United States re response to motion to intervene; Incorporate changes to response made by Jeff Balls and Wayne Klein; Review and finalize brief; Coordinate filing of brief	1.60	352.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**\$ 4,114.00****SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES**

Name	Rate	Hours	Total
Michael S. Lehr	220.00	18.70	4,114.00
TOTALS		18.70	\$ 4,114.00

COSTS ADVANCED

Date	Description	Amount
7/29/21	Keybank National Association - documents produced in response to subpoena in Jacqueline Freeborn case	66.00
8/31/21	Simplifile - County Recording Fees	180.00
9/13/21	DepomaxMerit Litigation Services - Randale Johnson deposition transcript	710.40
9/15/21	Advanced Reporting Solutions - LaGrand Johnson deposition transcript	902.45

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED**\$ 1,858.85****TOTAL THIS INVOICE****\$ 5,972.85**



October 15, 2021

RaPower-3 Receivership
Wayne Klein, Receiver
Klein & Associates
P.O. Box 1836
Salt Lake City, UT 84110

Invoice: 901278
Client: 176390
Matter: 1

REMITTANCE ADVICE

RE: Administration of Receivership Estate

BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE \$ 5,972.85

Please return this advice with payment to:

Parr Brown Gee & Loveless
P.O. Box 11019
Salt Lake City, UT 84147

Wire Transfer Instructions:

JP Morgan Chase Bank
201 South Main St Ste 300
Salt Lake City, UT 84111-2870
Swift Code #: CHASUS33
ABA #: 021000021
Parr Brown Gee & Loveless
Account #: 912454114

To Pay by Credit Card:

Visa Mastercard Discover Amex
Credit Card # _____
Expiration Date ____/____
Security Code # _____
Name on Account: _____
Billing Address: _____
Amount: \$ _____
Payments accepted by phone (801) 532-7840

ACH Payment Instructions

ABA Routing #: 124001545
Account #: 912454114

Online Payment: www.parrbrown.com

Please reference your invoice # 901278

Payable Upon Receipt

A finance charge of twelve percent (12%) per annum will accrue on any account not paid within thirty (30) days after the date of this invoice





October 15, 2021

RaPower-3 Receivership
Wayne Klein, Receiver
Klein & Associates
P.O. Box 1836
Salt Lake City, UT 84110

Invoice: 901280
Client: 176390
Matter: 3

INVOICE SUMMARY

Attorney: Jonathan O Hafen

For professional services rendered and costs advanced

RE: Appeal

Professional Services	\$ 26,194.00
Total Costs Advanced	<u> \$.00</u>
TOTAL THIS INVOICE	\$ 26,194.00

PARR BROWN GEE & LOVELESS

Invoice: 901280
 RaPower-3 Receivership
 Appeal

October 15, 2021
 Client: 176390
 Matter: 3

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
7/06/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee for Trudy Shepherd	2.20	638.00
7/07/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee for Trudy Shepherd	2.50	725.00
7/08/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee for Trudy Shepherd; Telephone conference with Clint Carpenter	7.60	2,204.00
7/08/21	MSL	Communication with Clint Carpenter of DOJ re Glenda Johnson's appeal of contempt orders	.30	66.00
7/09/21	JAB	Draft appellee brief for Trudy Shepherd	5.00	1,450.00
7/10/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee for Trudy Shepherd; Draft notice of appearance for Glenda Johnson lawsuit	3.50	1,015.00
7/12/21	JAB	Review and revise appellee brief for Trudy Shepherd	6.30	1,827.00
7/12/21	MSL	Communication with Jeff Balls re brief of the appellee in T. Shepard case; Review brief	.30	66.00
7/13/21	JAB	Review and revise appellee brief for Shepherd	6.40	1,856.00
7/13/21	MSL	Review and revise brief of the appellee in Tenth Circuit appeal of T. Shepard; Communication with Jeff Balls re same	2.00	440.00
7/14/21	JAB	Draft and revise brief of appellee for Trudy Shephard	3.50	1,015.00
7/14/21	MSL	Communication with Jeff Balls re standard of review on appeal in receivership and revisions to brief	.30	66.00
7/20/21	JAB	Prepare for and attend mediation conferences for Janet Roe; Review potential appeals	1.90	551.00
7/22/21	JAB	Prepare for and attend mediation	.80	232.00
7/26/21	JAB	Draft notice of appearance for Glenda Johnson appeal; Conference with Mike Lehr re same; Coordinate filing of same; Draft notice of appearance for Reinhold Finkes complaint; Review notice of mediation	.50	145.00
8/09/21	JAB	Review appellate documents for Reinhold Finkes	.20	58.00
8/11/21	JAB	Email Steven Paul re settlement status	.20	58.00
8/17/21	JAB	Attend Tenth Circuit mediation	.50	145.00
8/19/21	JAB	Review appellate brief from Glenda Johnson	1.00	290.00
8/23/21	JAB	Draft appellee brief for Glenda Johnson; Email Steven Paul re dismissal of Paul Jones appeal; Review status of cases	3.90	1,131.00
8/25/21	JAB	Review order consolidating cases	.20	58.00
9/07/21	JAB	Draft appellate brief for Glenda Johnson	1.80	522.00
9/08/21	JAB	Draft appellate brief for Glenda Johnson; Research case law re contempt on overturned order	1.50	435.00
9/09/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee re Glenda Johnson; Research case law	6.00	1,740.00
9/09/21	MSL	Draft motion for extension of time to file Appellee's brief; Communication with Jeff Balls re same; Review appellate rules re extensions; Coordinate filing re same	1.00	220.00
9/14/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee re Glenda Johnson	2.70	783.00
9/15/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee re Glenda Johnson	2.40	696.00

PARR BROWN GEE & LOVELESS

Invoice: 901280
 RaPower-3 Receivership
 Appeal

October 15, 2021
 Client: 176390
 Matter: 3

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
9/16/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee re Glenda Johnson	1.70	493.00
9/20/21	JAB	Review opposition to motion for extension of time; Draft brief of appellee re Glenda Johnson; Email Steven Paul re extension of time to file appellate brief	1.00	290.00
9/21/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee re Glenda Johnson; Review motion for extension of time filed by commission recipients	4.20	1,218.00
9/22/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee re Glenda Johnson	5.90	1,711.00
9/23/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee re Glenda Johnson	3.50	1,015.00
9/24/21	JAB	Draft brief of appellee re Glenda Johnson	1.30	377.00
9/24/21	MSL	Review and edit appellate brief re appeal filed by Glenda Johnson of attorneys fee order	.80	176.00
9/25/21	JAB	Review and revise appellate brief for Glenda Johnson	1.10	319.00
9/27/21	JAB	Review and revise appellate brief re Glenda Johnson	4.00	1,160.00
9/27/21	MSL	Draft motion to supplement record on appeal; Review district court docket re same; Communication with Jeff Balls re motion to supplement; Legal research re availability of fees expended during appeal; Communication with Jeff Balls re research results	3.90	858.00
9/28/21	JAB	Review order accepting appellate brief; Coordinate filing of paper copies with court	.50	145.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 26,194.00

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Rate	Hours	Total
Jeffery A Balls	290.00	83.80	24,302.00
Michael S. Lehr	220.00	8.60	1,892.00
TOTALS		92.40	\$ 26,194.00

TOTAL THIS INVOICE

\$ 26,194.00



October 15, 2021

RaPower-3 Receivership
Wayne Klein, Receiver
Klein & Associates
P.O. Box 1836
Salt Lake City, UT 84110

Invoice: 901280
Client: 176390
Matter: 3

REMITTANCE ADVICE

RE: Appeal

BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE \$ 26,194.00

Please return this advice with payment to:

Parr Brown Gee & Loveless
P.O. Box 11019
Salt Lake City, UT 84147

Wire Transfer Instructions:

JP Morgan Chase Bank
201 South Main St Ste 300
Salt Lake City, UT 84111-2870
Swift Code #: CHASUS33
ABA #: 021000021
Parr Brown Gee & Loveless
Account #: 912454114

To Pay by Credit Card:

Visa Mastercard Discover Amex
Credit Card # _____
Expiration Date ____/____
Security Code # _____
Name on Account: _____
Billing Address: _____
Amount: \$ _____
Payments accepted by phone (801) 532-7840

ACH Payment Instructions

ABA Routing #: 124001545
Account #: 912454114

Online Payment: www.parrbrown.com

Please reference your invoice # 901280

Payable Upon Receipt

A finance charge of twelve percent (12%) per annum will accrue on any account not paid within thirty (30) days after the date of this invoice





October 15, 2021

RaPower-3 Receivership
Wayne Klein, Receiver
Klein & Associates
P.O. Box 1836
Salt Lake City, UT 84110

Invoice: 901281
Client: 176390
Matter: 4

INVOICE SUMMARY

Attorney: Jonathan O Hafen

For professional services rendered and costs advanced

RE: Litigation

Professional Services	\$ 37,667.00
Total Costs Advanced	<u>\$ 17.45</u>
TOTAL THIS INVOICE	\$ 37,684.45

Invoice: 901281
 RaPower-3 Receivership
 Litigation

October 15, 2021
 Client: 176390
 Matter: 4

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
7/01/21	JAB	Draft notice of withdrawal; Conference with Mike Lehr re Ina Newman; Review correspondence re Taylor and Snow; Email Wayne Klein re Kinsey settlement	.80	232.00
7/02/21	JAB	Review email from Steven Paul re Snow and Taylor; Telephone conference with Steven Paul re same; Draft notice of filing for Kontos; Telephone conference with Steven Paul re Snow and Taylor settlement	1.30	377.00
7/02/21	MSL	Communication with Jeff Balls re status of various litigation	.30	66.00
7/06/21	JAB	Telephone conference with Andy Zeigler re payment; Email Wayne Klein re same; Draft motion to amend scheduling order for Snow and Taylor; Email Steven Paul re same; Draft stipulated notice of dismissal for Frank Lunn and Melvin Thomas Day; Email Steven Paul re same; Draft stipulated notice of dismissal for Mark Shepard; Email Mark Shepard re same; Email Miriam Strassberg re mediation; Revise supplemental briefing re 10th interim request for attorney fees	3.00	870.00
7/07/21	JAB	Review court orders re amended scheduling orders; Telephone conference with Steven Bowers	.40	116.00
7/08/21	JAB	Review scheduling orders	.10	29.00
7/08/21	MSL	Draft discovery request in Freeborn litigation; Draft subpoena to be served on Key Bank in Freeborn litigation; Draft notice of subpoena re same	1.80	396.00
7/10/21	JAB	Draft motion for default certificate against Frandsen; Review Hardship affidavit of Snow	.30	87.00
7/12/21	JAB	Conference with Mike Lehr re Hutchings; Telephone conference with Wayne Klein re same; Research information re Hutchings; Review memorandum in opposition to turnover; Email George Hailey re mediation; Review correspondence re settlement offer for Mark Manley; Email Wayne Klein re same	.90	261.00
7/12/21	MSL	Communication with Jeff Balls re Larry Hutchings case next steps; Draft status report in Hutching case; Coordinate filing re same	.70	154.00
7/12/21	MSL	Review opposition to motion for turnover of four properties in Glenda Johnson's name; Communication with Wayne Klein re same	.40	88.00
7/12/21	MSL	Coordinate service of subpoena on Key Bank in action against Freeborn	.20	44.00
7/13/21	JAB	Email Wayne Klein re mediation; Conference with Mike Lehr re Ina Newman documents; Email Wayne Klein re Andy Zeigler payment; Draft stipulated dismissal for Andy Zeigler; Email Andy Zeigler re same	.80	232.00
7/13/21	MSL	Draft second supplemental response Ina Newman's discovery requests; Compile documents; Communication with Wayne Klein and Jeff Balls re same; Communication with counsel for Newman re same; Communication with Wayne Klein in Glenda Johnson case re opposition to motion for turnover	1.20	264.00
7/14/21	MSL	Communication with J. Freeborn re discovery requests and notice of subpoena	.20	44.00

Invoice: 901281
 RaPower-3 Receivership
 Litigation

October 15, 2021
 Client: 176390
 Matter: 4

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
7/15/21	JAB	Review correspondence re settlement; Telephone conference with Steven Paul; Draft mediation memorandum for Plaskolite	1.30	377.00
7/16/21	JAB	Draft mediation brief for Plaskolite; Email Wayne Klein re same; Email Wayne Klein re Manley settlement agreement; Email Steve Paul re same; Review settlement offer re Dallas Plater; Email Wayne Klein re same; Email Steve Paul re same	3.10	899.00
7/19/21	JAB	Prepare for and attend mediation for Plaskolite; Email Glenda Johnson; Email Wayne Klein re due process orders and arguments; Draft motions to amend scheduling order for Randale Johnson, LeGrand Johnson, Glenda Johnson, and Matthew Shepard; Email Steve Paul re same	6.70	1,943.00
7/19/21	MSL	Draft reply in support of motion for turnover of real property; Review Glenda Johnson opposition to motion including exhibits; Review prior related filings re same; Communication with Wayne Klein re same; Incorporate changes to reply by Wayne Klein; Coordinate filing re same	3.10	682.00
7/19/21	MSL	Communication with Wayne Klein and Jeff Balls re Plakoliite mediation and claims against Plakolite	.60	132.00
7/20/21	JAB	Review asset search firms	.20	58.00
7/20/21	JAB	Telephone conference with Steven Paul; Revise proposed amended scheduling orders; Correspond with Glenda Johnson re amended scheduling order; Draft amended scheduling order for Glenda Johnson; Review settlement offer for Nicholas Kontos; Email Wayne Klein re same; Email Steve Paul re settlement for Nicholas Kontos; Review and revise motion for sale of Shepard home	2.60	754.00
7/21/21	JAB	Review settlement offer for Neil Searcy; Email Wayne Klein re same; Email Steven Paul re settlement; Review correspondence re Kontos; Review correspondence from Judge Nuffer's chambers	.50	145.00
7/22/21	JAB	Review settlement offer from Paul Jones; Review settlement offer from Lindy Welborn; Review and track various settlement offers; Telephone conference with Steven Paul re settlements	1.50	435.00
7/23/21	MSL	Draft request to submit re turnover motion in Glenda Johnson matter; Coordinate filings re same	.30	66.00
7/23/21	MSL	Communication with counsel for Jameson re scheduling	.10	22.00
7/27/21	JAB	Review correspondence from Steven Paul and Wayne Klein; Email Steven Paul	.90	261.00
7/27/21	MSL	Communication with Jeff Balls re trial order and claims against Ina Newman; Communication with Wayne Klein re Newman case	.30	66.00
7/28/21	JAB	Call Shane Luke and Steven Bowers; Review and revise quarterly report	.60	174.00
7/29/21	JAB	Conference with Mike Lehr re Ina Newman; Conference with Mike Lehr and Wayne Klein re Ina Newman and other cases; Finalize quarterly report; Coordinate filing of same	3.40	986.00
7/29/21	MSL	Prepare for meeting with Wayne Klein re claims, issues, and timeline in the Newman case; Attend meeting with Wayne Klein re same; Communication with Jeff Balls re issues involved in trial and settlement chances; Communication with counsel for Newman re settlement;	3.80	836.00

Invoice: 901281
 RaPower-3 Receivership
 Litigation

October 15, 2021
 Client: 176390
 Matter: 4

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
7/30/21	MSL	Communication with Jeff Balls re Newman trial and necessary filings to be made pre-trial	.30	66.00
8/05/21	JAB	Review motion to intervene; Email Wayne Klein re same	.20	58.00
8/05/21	MSL	Communication with Wayne Klein re settlement of claims against Ina Newman; Communication with counsel for Newman re same	.50	110.00
8/05/21	MSL	Review order re turnover of four Glenda Johnson properties; Communication with Wayne Klein re same	.30	66.00
8/06/21	JAB	Review order granting motion for turnover of real property; Email same to Steven Paul; Coordinate mailing of same to Neldon Johnson; Conference with Austin Bybee re jury trial; Telephone conference with Kirk Newman re payments; Email Wayne Klein re same; Email Wayne Klein re depositions; Conference with Mike Lehr	2.10	609.00
8/06/21	MSL	Communication with Wayne Klein re settlement with Newman; Communication with counsel for Newman re same	.40	88.00
8/06/21	ADB	Meeting with Jeff Balls re motion in limine	.40	88.00
8/10/21	JAB	Telephone conference with Wayne Klein re Plaskolite; Draft pretrial disclosures for Ina Newman; Review and revise motion to approve settlements	6.30	1,827.00
8/10/21	MSL	Communication with Wayne Klein re settlement with Ina Newman; Communication with counsel for Newman re same	.40	88.00
8/10/21	ADB	Research re whether an individual is entitled to a jury trial	.90	198.00
8/11/21	JAB	Correspond with Wayne Klein re motion to approve settlements; Draft proposed order for same; Coordinate filing of same; Email Monica Call	1.60	464.00
8/11/21	MSL	Communication with counsel for Ina Newman re settlement terms; Communication with Wayne Klein re same	.60	132.00
8/12/21	JAB	Review research re jury trial; Call Steve Bowers; Call Shane Luke	.30	87.00
8/12/21	ADB	Finished research re whether a defendant is entitled to a jury trial when the specific causes of action include fraudulent transfer and unjust enrichment; Draft research memo re the same	3.30	726.00
8/13/21	JAB	Draft motion for summary judgment against Plaskolite; Draft deeds for Glenda E. Johnson to sign for turnover of properties; Email Glenda Johnson re same; Draft notice of settlement for Ina Marie Newman; Review errata to motion to intervene; Telephone conference with Steven Paul; Draft motion for extension of time for Taylor and Snow; Email Steven Paul re same; Review and revise proposed admissions for Taylor and Snow; Email Wayne Klein re same	5.30	1,537.00
8/13/21	MSL	Communication with Wayne Klein and counsel for Ina Newman re settlement agreement	.20	44.00
8/16/21	JAB	Telephone conference with Shane Luke	.10	29.00
8/17/21	JAB	Review correspondence re Plaskolite; Telephone conference with Monica Call and Philip Downey	.60	174.00
8/18/21	JAB	Telephone conference with Monica Call and Phillip Downey	.40	116.00

Invoice: 901281
 RaPower-3 Receivership
 Litigation

October 15, 2021
 Client: 176390
 Matter: 4

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
8/19/21	JAB	Review voicemail from Shane Luke; Telephone conference with Monica Call; Review settlement language for Taylor and Snow; Email Steven Paul re same; Telephone conference with Shane Luke; Telephone conference with Wayne Klein re Shane Luke	3.10	899.00
8/20/21	JAB	Review correspondence from Wayne Klein; Email Steven Paul re depositions; Draft deposition notices for LeGrand Johnson, Randale Johnson, and Matthew Shepard; Telephone conference with Shane Luke; Telephone conference with Steve Bowers; Draft discovery requests to Jeron Johnson; Draft motion to amend Plaskolite scheduling order; Email Monica Call	4.30	1,247.00
8/23/21	JAB	Review email re bankruptcy of Jeron Johnson; Review bankruptcy pleadings for Jeron Johnson; Email Wayne Klein re same; Draft amended complaint for Glenda Johnson; Prepare deposition outline for LaGrand Johnson; Review discovery responses from LaGrand Johnson	2.80	812.00
8/23/21	MSL	Communication with counsel for Jameson re extension to scheduling order	.20	44.00
8/24/21	JAB	Draft notice of bankruptcy for Jeron Johnson; Prepare for deposition of LeGrand Johnson; Review and revise litigation status report; Email Wayne Klein re same; Coordinate filing of litigation status report; Conference with Wayne Klein re depositions	5.20	1,508.00
8/25/21	JAB	Draft satisfaction of judgment for Manley, Plater, and Kontos; Draft motion for summary judgment against Steven King and Raleigh Stewart; Correspond with Wayne Klein re Shane Luke; Call Steve Bowers; Draft outline for LeGrand Johnson Deposition	5.40	1,566.00
8/26/21	JAB	Prepare for depositions of Randale and LaGrand Johnson; Review documents	1.60	464.00
8/27/21	JAB	Prepare for depositions of Randale and LaGrand Johnson; Review documents	1.20	348.00
8/30/21	JAB	Prepare for and take deposition of LaGrand Johnson	8.40	2,436.00
8/30/21	MSL	Communication with Jeff Balls and Wayne Klein re deeds to four properties in Millard County related to Glenda Johnson litigation	.20	44.00
8/31/21	JAB	Prepare for and depose Randale Johnson; Finalize motion for summary judgment for Steven King and Raleigh Stewart; Prepare exhibits for summary judgment motion; Prepare for deposition of Matthew Shepard	9.90	2,871.00
9/01/21	JAB	Prepare for and depose Matthew Shepard; Review request for payoff; Telephone conference with Laren Nalder; Telephone conference with Wayne Klein re same	4.80	1,392.00
9/02/21	JAB	Finalize amended complaint for Glenda Johnson	.40	116.00
9/07/21	JAB	Review correspondence	.40	116.00
9/08/21	JAB	Conference with Mike Lehr re status of cases; Review expert report re insolvency; Call Shane Luke re settlement; Review motion to intervene	2.90	841.00
9/08/21	MSL	Review Key Bank records in Freeborn case; Review Freeborn production; Communication with Jeff Balls re same	.80	176.00

Invoice: 901281
 RaPower-3 Receivership
 Litigation

October 15, 2021
 Client: 176390
 Matter: 4

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
9/09/21	JAB	Conference with Mike Lehr re motion to intervene; Review corrected receivership order; Telephone conference with Wayne Klein re same	1.10	319.00
9/10/21	JAB	Draft satisfaction of judgment for Lindy Welborn; Email Cristian Gomez re expert report	.90	261.00
9/12/21	MSL	Research re experts opining as to ultimate conclusions; Draft communication with Wayne Klein re expert reports in Jameson case	1.00	220.00
9/13/21	JAB	Review correspondence re expert reports, account statements, and deposition transcripts	.40	116.00
9/13/21	MSL	Communication with Wayne Klein and conflicts counsel re expert reports; Review expert reports; Communication with Jeff Balls re same	.40	88.00
9/14/21	JAB	Telephone conference with Shane Luke; Review opposition to motion to intervene	1.00	290.00
9/15/21	JAB	Conference with Mike Lehr	.60	174.00
9/16/21	JAB	Conference with Mike Lehr; Review expert reports; Conference with Mike Lehr, Wayne Klein, David Castleberry, and Mitch Longson	3.20	928.00
9/16/21	MSL	Prepare for conference with Wayne Klein, Jeff Balls, David Castleberry, and Mitch Longson including reviewing expert reports and relevant caselaw; Attend conference with Wayne Klein, Jeff Balls, David Castleberry, and Mitch Longson	1.20	264.00
9/21/21	JAB	Email Phil Downey re deposition	.10	29.00
9/23/21	JAB	Review email re Shane Luke payment; Email Wayne Klein re same; Email Shane Luke re settlement; Call Steven Bowers	.40	116.00
9/24/21	JAB	Email Phil Downey re deposition and scheduling order	.50	145.00
9/27/21	JAB	Email Mitch Longson re summary judgment motion	.10	29.00
9/28/21	JAB	Telephone conference with Steven Paul; Draft motion for extension for Taylor and Snow; Review case status; Draft dismissal of Shane Luke; Email Shane Luke re same	2.40	696.00
9/29/21	JAB	Review status of litigation; Draft motion for default judgment against Jason Clement and Frandsen	2.20	638.00
9/30/21	JAB	Draft motions for default against Jason Clement and Jay Frandsen; Correspond with Cynthia Love	2.70	783.00
9/30/21	MSL	Communication with Jeff Balls and Wayne Klein re rebuttal expert testimony in Jameson case; Communication with Wayne Klein re bank records in Freeborn case	.40	88.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 37,667.00

Invoice: 901281
 RaPower-3 Receivership
 Litigation

October 15, 2021
 Client: 176390
 Matter: 4

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Rate	Hours	Total
Jeffery A Balls	290.00	111.30	32,277.00
Michael S. Lehr	220.00	19.90	4,378.00
Austin D Bybee	220.00	4.60	1,012.00
TOTALS		135.80	\$ 37,667.00

COSTS ADVANCED

Date	Description	Amount
8/13/21	Millard County Recorder - recording fees	11.00
8/13/21	Millard County Recorder - recording fees	1.50
	Copies - B & W	4.95

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED \$ 17.45

TOTAL THIS INVOICE \$ 37,684.45



October 15, 2021

RaPower-3 Receivership
Wayne Klein, Receiver
Klein & Associates
P.O. Box 1836
Salt Lake City, UT 84110

Invoice: 901281
Client: 176390
Matter: 4

REMITTANCE ADVICE

RE: Litigation

BALANCE DUE THIS INVOICE \$ 37,684.45

Please return this advice with payment to:

Parr Brown Gee & Loveless
P.O. Box 11019
Salt Lake City, UT 84147

Wire Transfer Instructions:

JP Morgan Chase Bank
201 South Main St Ste 300
Salt Lake City, UT 84111-2870
Swift Code #: CHASUS33
ABA #: 021000021
Parr Brown Gee & Loveless
Account #: 912454114

To Pay by Credit Card:

Visa Mastercard Discover Amex
Credit Card # _____
Expiration Date ____/____
Security Code # _____
Name on Account: _____
Billing Address: _____
Amount: \$ _____
Payments accepted by phone (801) 532-7840

ACH Payment Instructions

ABA Routing #: 124001545
Account #: 912454114

Online Payment: www.parrbrown.com

Please reference your invoice # 901281

Payable Upon Receipt

A finance charge of twelve percent (12%) per annum will accrue on any account not paid within thirty (30) days after the date of this invoice

