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From: Roger Halverson (rhalverson@bellsouth.net)
To: greg@bfsmail.com;

Date: Thu, June 2, 2011 1:51:02 PM

Cc: m3brandon@gmail.com; aneff555@gmail.com;
Subject: Fw: IASU

Greg,

Ms Lambrecht is most anxious to find out what is going on with her investment and we still haven't
received any response from Mr. Johnson or anyone else. Please ask him to get in touch or send me the
contact information so I can call and correspond with him.

Thank you

Roger

----- Forwarded Message ----

From: Roger Halverson <rhaiverson@bellsouth.net>
To: Greg Shepard <greg@bfsmail.com>

Cc: Melissa Brandon <m3brandon@gmail.com>
Sent: Thu, May 12, 2011 11:44:27 AM

Subject: Re: IASU

Greg,
I havn't receved any other information from Neldon Johnson or you and

I got tied up with a busy tax season, so Please follow up with me as
SO0M as you can.

Roger

From: Greg Shepard <greg@bfsmail.com>
To: rhalverson@bellsouth.net

Sent: Wed, January 19, 2011 5:32:41 PM
Subject: Re: IASU
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Roger, OK. Thanks. | have forwarded this e-mail to Neldon Johnson, the CEO of IAUS. He
is handling Patti's account himself so | don't know the particulars. Sorry for the confusion.
Patti's transaction was in 2008 so when you said a little over a year ago, it didn't register. 1 will
follow through with Neldon.

Thanks, Greg Shepard 801-699-2284

----- QOriginal Message -----

From: Roger Halverson [mailto:rhalverson@belisouth.net]
To: greg@bfsmail.com

Sent: Wed, 19 Jan 2011 13:10:11 -0800 (PST)

Subject: Re: IASU

The contract is in the name of ILIOS, LLC. The member is Patricia Lambrecht,
and the check that was received was payable to her.

Roger

From: Greg Shepard <greg@bfsmail.com>
To: rhalverson@bellsouth.net

Sent: Wed, January 19, 2011 12:04:53 PM
Subject: RE: IASU

Roger, Please remind me who your client is. We have hundreds of RaPower3 Team
Members. Thanks, Greg

Greg Shepard

RaPower3-Chief Director of Operations
843 W 2400 S

Salt Lake City, UT 84119

Cell 801-699-2284

Fax 801-975-1159

www.rapower3.com

NOTICE: This copyrighted email and any files transmitted with it are
confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom
they are addressed and may be subject to legal privilege. If you have received
this email in error, please notify the system manager. You should not
disseminate, distribute or copy this email. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any
action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited.
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-~ QOriginal Message -—-

From: Roger Halverson [mailto:rhalverson@bellsouth.net]
To: greg@bfsmail.com

Cc: m3brandon@gmail.com,aneff555@gmail.com

Sent: Wed, 19 Jan 2011 07:23:42 -0800 (PST)

Subject: IASU

Greg,

| spoke with you a little over a year ago when a client of mine was preparing to
purchase solar energy equipment with IASU, regarding the tax implications.

My client did purchase some units in Dec of 2009. Recently she received a check
for $7500.00 from RAPOWER-3 LLC. This is the first we have heard anything about

her units. | wrote to 1ASU in Sept 2010 asking for information about her units
and an update as to what is going on, and never heard back from them.

This is disturbing to my client as well as myself.

The check states it is for the 3rd quarter power purchase. What about the 1st
and 2nd quarters? Also, can you provide a schedule or statement as to how the
power purchase is determined? Will we receive quarterly distribution going
forward?

Any information we could obtain would me most appreciated.

Sincerely,

Roger W. Halverson, CPA

772-283-3535
772-283-3899 Fax
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