

January 15, 2023

RaPower-3 Receivership Wayne Klein, Receiver Klein & Associates P.O. Box 1836 Salt Lake City, UT 84110

Invoice: 920589 Client: 176390 Matter: 1

INVOICE SUMMARY

Attorney: Jonathan O Hafen

For professional services rendered and costs advanced

RE: Administration of Receivership Estate

Professional Services \$.00
Total Costs Advanced \$.00

TOTAL THIS INVOICE \$.00





Invoice: 920589

RaPower-3 Receivership

Administration of Receivership Estate

January 15, 2023

Client: 176390

Matter: 1

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
10/19/22	JAB	No Charge - Draft attorney fees application and order granting motion for fees	1.00	N/C
10/21/22	JAB	No Charge - Review attorney fees; Draft attorney fees motion	1.00	N/C
11/09/22	JAB	No Charge - Draft motion for award of attorney fees; Email Dan Applegate re same; Email Wayne Klein	1.40	N/C
		TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES		\$.00
		TOTAL THIS INVOICE		\$.00



January 15, 2023

RaPower-3 Receivership Wayne Klein, Receiver Klein & Associates P.O. Box 1836 Salt Lake City, UT 84110

Invoice: 920590 Client: 176390 Matter: 4

INVOICE SUMMARY

Attorney: Jonathan O Hafen

For professional services rendered and costs advanced

RE: Litigation

Professional Services \$47,295.50 Total Costs Advanced \$2,335.40

TOTAL THIS INVOICE \$49,630.90





Invoice: 920590 January 15, 2023
RaPower-3 Receivership Client: 176390
Litigation Matter: 4

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
10/03/22	JAB	Review quarterly report; Email Wayne Klein re same	.50	145.00
10/04/22	JAB	Finalize quarterly report and arrange for filing of same	.20	58.00
10/11/22	JAB	Call Glenda Johnson; Revise scheduling order; Review documents from Robert Tilden; Email Robert Tilden re same	.70	203.00
10/12/22	JAB	Review filing re amended scheduling order; Review order re status report for Jameson; Telephone conference with Robert Tilden	.60	174.00
10/13/22	JAB	Correspond with Wayne Klein; Review garnishment information; Participate in garnishment hearing re Tilden	1.20	348.00
10/18/22	JAB	Telephone conference with Justin Heideman; Coordinate for research re Richard Jameson estate; Draft status update	.70	203.00
10/19/22	AB	Review state court fillings for possible probate for Richard Jameson; Conference with Jeffery Balls re same	.20	45.00
10/20/22	JAB	Email Wayne Klein re motion to approve settlement agreement and status report; Correspond with Justin Heideman re same; Review and revise motion to approve settlement agreement and order re same	1.10	319.00
10/21/22	JAB	Email Justin Heideman re status update; Contact Wichita Falls Federal Credit Union; Telephone conference with Jan Waldmuller re First National Bank garnishment	1.50	435.00
10/24/22	JAB	Telephone conference with Susan at Wichita Falls Teachers Federal Credit Union re garnishment; Draft letter to Wichita Falls Teachers Federal Credit Union	1.00	290.00
10/28/22	JAB	Review correspondence and investment information from Robert Tilden; Email Wayne Klein re same; Review pleadings re Robert Tilden	.80	232.00
10/31/22	JAB	Review and revise settlement agreement for Robert Tilden; Correspond with Wayne Klein; Email Robert Tilden	.90	261.00
11/01/22	JAB	Review second amended scheduling order for Taylor and Snow; Review jury instructions and jury verdict form	1.80	522.00
11/02/22	JAB	Review order re pretrial hearing; Review and revise jury instructions and verdict form; Email Wayne Klein re matter	1.00	290.00
11/03/22	JAB	Review correspondence from Wayne Klein; Revise special verdict form and jury instructions	.80	232.00
11/04/22	JAB	Review tenth circuit decision on Preston Olsen tax case; Email Wayne Klein re Tilden settlement; Email Robert Tilden re settlement	.90	261.00
11/07/22	JAB	Telephone conference with Jeanene Hawley; Email Magistrate Kohler re Tilden hearing	.30	87.00
11/08/22	JAB	Email Robert Tilden re status of case	.10	29.00
11/09/22	JAB	Email Jan Waldmuller re garnishment; Review garnishment documents	.30	87.00
11/11/22	JAB	Review correspondence from Wayne Klein; Conference with Jasmine Leonardi re trial	.40	116.00
11/14/22	JAB	Telephone conference with Lori Tucker re garnishment; Review garnishment responses	.90	261.00

Invoice: 920590 January 15, 2023
RaPower-3 Receivership Client: 176390
Litigation Matter: 4

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
11/15/22	JAB	Finalize motion and order to assign judgment; Finalize 16th motion to approve settlements; Review and revise notice of sale result; Correspond with Wayne Klein re same	1.50	435.00
11/17/22	JAB	Review correspondence from Jasmine re trial; Review documents for trial; Review garnishment documents	1.10	319.00
11/18/22	JAB	Call Wichita Fall Teachers Credit Union re garnishment of John Howell; Email First National Bank re garnishments; Email Robert Tilden re timing	.50	145.00
11/19/22	JAB	Review deposition of Neldon Johnson and LTB1; Review pleadings for Snow/Taylor trial	3.00	870.00
11/21/22	JAB	Telephone conference with Teachers Credit Union re confirmation that funds would be sent for the garnishment; Review deposition	1.40	406.00
11/22/22	JAB	Review and revise jury instructions; Email Wayne Klein re same; Review supplemental memorandum re Georgelas case; Review deposition transcript	2.90	841.00
11/25/22	JAB	Review deposition of LTB1 and Neldon Johnson; Email Wayne Klein re deposition designation; Email First National Bank re garnishment; Review litigation report	2.10	609.00
11/26/22	JAB	Review jury instructions; Email Wayne Klein re jury instructions	.30	87.00
11/28/22	JAB	Review and revise trial order; Review correspondence from Wayne Klein re deposition designations;	1.00	290.00
11/29/22	JAB	Telephone conference with Michael Broome re garnishment	.20	58.00
11/30/22	JAB	Correspond with Robert Tilden; Draft request to submit for decision; Draft notice of filing and proposed edits to jury instructions and verdict form	.90	261.00
12/01/22	JAB	Correspond with Tom Melton; Review documents for Tom Melton's review; Review notice of supplemental authority for Plaskolite matter; Review Plaksolite pleadings	2.30	667.00
12/01/22	TMM	Review motions and trial memoranda; Telephone conference with Jeff Balls re trial preparation	7.20	3,564.00
12/02/22	JAB	Review settlement checks from First National Bank; Email Wayne Klein re same; Telephone conference with Tom Melton	.90	261.00
12/02/22	TMM	Review Complaint and Answer; Review exhibits	7.60	3,762.00
12/05/22	JAB	Correspondence with Wayne Klein re Plaskolite	.10	29.00
12/05/22	TMM	Review exhibits	5.40	2,673.00
12/06/22	TMM	Review exhibits and jury instructions	5.50	2,722.50
12/07/22	TMM	Review jury instructions	4.30	2,128.50
12/08/22	JAB	Draft notice of assignment of judgment for Matt Shepard; Review trial order for Snow/Taylor	.30	87.00
12/08/22	TMM	Review exhibits	2.00	990.00
12/09/22	TMM	Review decision in tax case and exhibits	3.80	1,881.00
12/10/22	JAB	Revise trial brief; Revise second pre trial order; Email Wayne Klein and Tom Melton re same	.70	203.00

Invoice: 920590 January 15, 2023
RaPower-3 Receivership Client: 176390
Litigation Matter: 4

Date	Tkpr	Description	Hours	Amount
12/12/22	JAB	Review and revise trial brief; Telephone conference with Wayne Klein re Steven King check; Revise trial exhibits for Snow/Taylor trial; Coordinate revision of trial exhibits with Jasmine Leonardi; Revise pre- trial brief; Email Steven Paul re same		1,073.00
12/12/22	TMM	Review trial brief and emails re same		1,782.00
12/13/22	JAB	Review and revise pre-trial order	.40	116.00
12/14/22	JAB	Email Steven Paul re pre-trial order; Telephone conference with Steven Paul; Email Court re pre-trial order	1.20	348.00
12/14/22	TMM	Review jury instructions	3.80	1,881.00
12/15/22	JAB	Conference with Tom Melton and Wayne Klein; Email Robert Tilden; Draft trial outline for Wayne Klein		493.00
12/15/22	TMM	Review documents and prepare outlines; Meeting with client re trial	5.50	2,722.50
12/17/22	JAB	Review and revise claims registry	3.20	928.00
12/19/22	JAB	Email Wayne Klein re pre-trial conference; Prepare for pre-trial conference; Review Snow/Taylor instructions; Correspond with Steve Paul; Attend pre-trial conference; Conference with Wayne Klein and Tom Melton; Coordinate with Jasmine Leonardi; Review orders and correspondence from court; Email court re word documents	4.70	1,363.00
12/19/22	TMM	Prepare for and attend pretrial conference	3.00	1,485.00
12/19/22	JL	Attend pretrial conference; Discussion with team re trial preparation	1.00	150.00
12/20/22	JL	Email correspondence with Jeff Balls re trial preparation; Review court form exhibit and witness lists	.10	15.00
12/21/22	JAB	Review correspondence from Steven Paul; Review jury instructions; Correspond with Wayne Klein and Tom Melton re same	.90	261.00
12/21/22	TMM	Review jury instructions	3.40	1,683.00
12/22/22	JAB	Draft trial outline	1.80	522.00
12/23/22	JAB	Draft trial outline	2.70	783.00
12/23/22	JL	Contact court reporter re daily transcript request at trial	.10	15.00
12/27/22	JAB	Draft trial testimony outline for Wayne Klein	2.90	841.00
12/28/22	JAB	Draft trial outline for Wayne Klein; Review trial exhibits	5.80	1,682.00
12/28/22	JL	Discussion with Jeffery Balls re trial exhibits; Update trial exhibits and index	.50	75.00
12/29/22	JAB	Draft trial outline; Review documents for Snow/Taylor trial; Telephone conference with Mike Skolnick	3.30	957.00
12/29/22	JL	Contact Ryan Robertson at federal court re trial equipment setup	.10	15.00
12/30/22	JAB	Review motion to amend scheduling order; Correspond with Mike Skolnick	.10	29.00
12/30/22	JL	Correspond with Jeffery Balls re trial preparation	.10	15.00
12/31/22	JAB	Correspond with Wayne Klein re Snow/Taylor trial and potential settlement; Review documents re Snow/Taylor	.60	174.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

\$ 47,295.50

Invoice: 920590
RaPower-3 Receivership
Litigation

January 15, 2023
Client: 176390
Matter: 4

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Rate	Hours	Total
Jeffery A Balls	290.00	67.90	19,691.00
Thomas M Melton	495.00	55.10	27,274.50
Jasmine Leonardi - Paralegal	150.00	1.90	285.00
Amanda Bradley - Paralegal	225.00	.20	45.00
TOTALS		125.10	\$ 47,295.50

COSTS ADVANCED

Date	Description	Amount
1/06/23	Salt Lake City Parking - Jasmine Leonardi	2.25
1/06/23	Salt Lake City Parking - Jasmine Leonardi	4.00
1/09/23	Roula's Cafe - Thomas Melton	37.24
1/09/23	City Creek Parking - Jeffrey Balls	10.00
1/09/23	Zephyr Lot - Jasmine Leonardi parking	10.00
1/09/23	City Creek Parking - Thomas Melton	10.00
1/10/23	Roula's Cafe - Jasmine Leonardi	42.65
1/10/23	Roula's Cafe - Thomas Melton	11.05
1/10/23	City Creek Parking - Jeffrey Balls	10.00
1/10/23	City Creek Parking - Jasmine Leonardi	10.00
1/10/23	City Creek Parking - Thomas Melton	10.00
1/10/23	Michelle Gonsalves - Trial Transcript 2nd day-Jan. 10, 2023	229.90
1/10/23	K&D Marketing Services - Trial Transcript (1-9-2023/1-10-2023)-Leg 1	1,331.00
1/11/23	Roula's Cafe - Jasmine Leonardi	6.51
1/11/23	City Creek Parking - Jeffrey Balls	10.00
1/11/23	City Creek Parking - Thomas MElton	10.00
1/11/23	City Creek Parking - Jasmine Leonardi	10.00
1/23/23	Teena Green - Daily Transcript from 1-10-2023	580.80

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED \$ 2,335.40

TOTAL THIS INVOICE \$ 49,630.90